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Law Offices of Stephen Bialkowski, LLC is a boutique construction law firm that is committed to 
serving the legal needs of the construction community.  With our law offices located on Wall Street in 
New York and Ramsey, New Jersey, we are able to represent a wide range of clients in a large 
geographical area. We are well-versed with New York and New Jersey construction law and have 
assisted Owners, Construction Managers, General Contractors, Subcontractors, Suppliers, 
Architects and Engineers with a wide range of problems.  Our insightful approach to cases strives to 
ensure a prompt and cost effective resolution to the many issues our clients face.  In addition to 
representing clients throughout New Jersey and New York, we also represent many companies in 
different states with legal needs in New York and New Jersey.  Our group of highly skilled attorneys 
are dedicated to the construction industry and no matter is too big or too small for us to handle. 

The founding member of the firm, Stephen Bialkowski, has his roots in the construction industry.  He 
was actively involved with a family-owned general contracting company before pursuing a career in 
the law.  He is a graduate of Seton Hall University School of Law where he was a member of the 
Law Review.  Following graduation, Mr. Bialkowski gained valuable experience at prominent New 
York and New Jersey law firms where he represented clients in leading cases across the 
country.  Using his unique construction background and skills garnered at preeminent law firms, Mr. 
Bialkowski has been able to grow a client base of large commercial contractors, developers, trade 
contractors, suppliers, architects and engineers.  In 2011, Mr. Bialkowski was the recipient of Top 
Lawyer honors in the areas of Commercial Litigation, Business Litigation, Transactional Law and 
Alternative Dispute Resolution.  

Apart from his duties as legal counsel, Mr. Bialkowski has also served the construction industry in 
many ways.  He is the General Counsel to the Construction Roundtable of New Jersey; a past 
arbitrator with the American Arbitration Association; and Co-Secretary to the Construction and Public 
Law Section of the New Jersey Bar Association.  The most rewarding work he does is teaching.  As 
a member of the faculty at NYU for more than 23 years, Mr. Bialkowski has taught many 
construction related courses, including, Construction Law, Legal Principles and Practices for 
Construction Management Master’s students and Construction Essentials for Real Estate 
Developers.  He is also a frequent guest lecturer on construction related issues for colleges, 
associations and bar related organizations.  

The attorneys at the Law Offices of Stephen Bialkowski, LLC are licensed to appear in both New 
York and New Jersey courts as well as the U.S. District Court for the Districts of New Jersey, 
Southern District of New York and Eastern District of New York, the U.S. Court of Appeals for the 
2nd and 3rd Circuits and the United States Supreme Court. 

We put the needs of our clients first and are relentless in our pursuit to see that those needs are 
satisfied. 

 


